Port Arthur Housing Authority

IFB No. B15018
Domestic Appliances

Notice of Successful Bids
December 28, 2015
TO:  All Bidders in response to the above noted IFB.
We are pleased to announce that, as a result of our evaluation of the bids received in response to the above noted IFB, we anticipate awards to:

General Electric Company of Louisville, Kentucky

Sears Commercial Sales of Augusta, Georgia

Whirlpool Corporation of Knoxville, Tennessee

The following table shows the amounts bid, with the awarded bid highlighted.
                                                                                                          Table No. 1
	
Item
	
Description
	General Electric
	Sears Commercial
	Whirlpool Corporation

	1
	GE 17.5 cu ft Top-Freezer Refrigerator with Single Ice Maker (White) (Energy Star) (or equal)
	$515.00
	$536.00
	$583.00

	2
	GE 1.4 cu ft 1100 watt countertop microwave (white) (or equal)
	$98.00
	$128.00
	$172.00

	3
	GE 1.9 cf over-the-range microwave with sensor cooking controls (white) (or equal)
	$215.00
	$206.00
	$220.00

	4
	GE freestanding 4.8 cf gas range (white) (or equal)
	$407.00
	$446.00
	$547.00

	5
	GE Freestanding 5.3 cu ft Self-Cleaning Electric Range (White) (or equal)
	$351.00
	$336.00
	$489.00

	6
	GE 54-decible built-in dishwasher with hard food disposer (white) (or equal)
	$307.00
	$326.00
	$289.00

	7
	Whirlpool gas 50 gal. water heater (or equal)
	(No bid)
	$476.00
	(No bid)

	8
	Whirlpool electric 50 gal. water heater (or equal)
	(No bid)
	$356.00
	(No bid)

	9
	Whirlpool electric 38 gal. lowboy water heater (or equal)
	(No bid)
	$346.00
	(No bid)


We remind each bidder of his/her right to a debriefing and the right to protest.  Please note that the Agency must receive written notice of either within 10 days of the receipt of this Notice.

We are grateful for your interest in doing business with our Agency and we will ensure that you receive similar notices from our Agency in the future.   
Alyce Williams, Procurement Officer
HOUSING AUTHORITY OF THE CITY OF PORT ARTHUR
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