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Economic Engine

Plusix
Unit Price
Extended
Item # Agency Stock Code Qty u/m Price
1 2 Each $1,516.39
$3,032.78
(No Award)
CHWB8990CW - Energy Star WHIRLPOOL Commercial Washer, Coin Operated, Front-load, 3.2 cuft, 6
cycles, front electronic controls, with 4 inch pedestal, hoses, installed at Autumn Village
Apartments, 1712 East 39th Street, Kearney NE 68847. Shipping or any other fees to be included in
bid., or equal.
Comments to bidders, if any:
2 2 Each No Bid
(No Award)
CED8990XW - Energy Star WHIRLPOOL Commercial Front-Load Electric Dryer, Coin Operated, front
electronic controls, with 4 inch pedestal, installed at Autumn Village Apartments, 1712 East 39th
Street, Kearney NE 68847. Shipping or any other fees to be included in bid., or equal.
Comments to bidders, if any:
3 2 Each No Bid
(No Award)
CED8990XW - Energy Star WHIRLPOOL Commercial Front-Load Electric Dryer, Coin Operated, front
electronic controls, with 4 inch pedestal, installed at East View Court Apartments, 849 2nd Street,
Minden NE 6959. Shipping and installation or any other fees to be included in bid., or equal.
Comments to bidders, if any:
4 1 Each $1,516.39
$1,516.39
(No Award)
CHW8990CW - Energy Star WHIRLPOOL Commercial Washer, Coin Operated, Front-load, 3.2 cuft, 6
cycles, front electronic controls, with 4 inch pedestal, hoses, installed at Kearney Manor
Apartments, 2715 Avenue I, Kearney NE 68847, Shipping and installation or any other fees to be
included in bid., or equal.
Comments to bidders, if any:
5 7 Each No Bid
(No Award)
CED8990XW - Energy Star WHIRLPOOL Commercial Front-Load Electric Dryer, Coin Operated, front
electronic controls, with 4 inch pedestal, installed at Kearney Manor Apartments, 2715 Avenue I,
Kearney NE 68847. Shipping and installation or any other fees to be included in bid., or equal.
Comments to bidders, if any:
6 4 Each No Bid
(No Award)
CED8990XW - Energy Star WHIRLPOOL Commercial Front-Load Electric Dryer, Coin Operated, front
electronic controls, with 4 inch pedestal, installed at Colony Acres Apartments, 413 1st Street,
Gibbon NE 68840. Shipping and installation or any other fees to be included in bid., or equal.
Comments to bidders, if any:
7 5 Each No Bid
(No Award)

CED8990XW - Energy Star WHIRLPOOL Commercial Front-Load Electric Dryer, Coin Operated, front
electronic controls, with 4 inch pedestal, installed at Plaza Boulevard Apartments, 50 Plaza
Boulevard, Kearney NE 68847. Shipping and installation or any other fees to be included in bid., or
equal.

Comments to bidders, if any:
Lot Totals: $ 4,549.17

Plusix
Vendor Totals: $4,549.17

(Qty x Per Unit Price)
Selected Vendor Totals: $0
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$2,216.28
$4,432.56

$1,714.68
$3,429.36

$1,714.68
$3,429.36

$2,216.28
$2,216.28

$1,714.68
$12,002.76

$1,714.68
$6,858.72

$1,714.68
$8,573.40

$
40,942.44
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